10/13/2021 TOWN OF RICHMOND Accounts Payable Page 1 of 1
01:46 pm Check Warrant Report # 7278 Current Prior Next FY Invoices Finance
Unpaid Invoices For Check Acct 01 (GENERAL) From 10/14/2021 To 10/14/2021

Purchase Discount Amount Check Check
Vendor Invoice Invoice Description Amount Amount Paid Number Date
PRESTON  WRIGHT C PRESTON 101221 Reimb Andrews Forrest su 337.61 0.00 ~~——=—-- fom mmmmeemm o /==/--
Report Total 337.61 0.00 0.00

The invoices and warrant in this packet have been reviewed by the Town Manager. The Town Manager's signature is for

purposes of review only, and in no way is approval of the warrant or payment of the invoices.

Josh Arneson

Town Manager

To the Treasurer of TOWN OF RICHMOND, We Hereby certify that there is due to the several persons whose names are listed hereon
the sum against each name and that there are good and sufficient vouchers supporting the payments aggregating § **%#*+*%337, 61

Let this be your order for the payments of these amounts.

SELECTBOARD

Christine Werneke David Sander Bard Hill June D. Heston Jay Furr



TOWN OF RICHMOND

EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT FORM
(Staff, Board, and Volunteers Only)

Today's Date

Date Rec'd in Acct.

/o/ﬁ_g/'x,l |

Name/Payee

UHS LL"’ C [ PMSTBL)

[T Check if new address

Street Address | 257, Y/ ‘. 5&-’/}.’,{ LR ELAND )

LicumonDd
City

Var gl
State

osq+t

Zip Code

Reason for Expense

Bow&m;, &‘L#fﬁ; + Wtness PeBIE tugtelled

ITEMIZED EXPENSES

[ Receipts attached

Date Incurred ltem $ Amount GL Account
?l/.zo’/)./ See ATIRCHED 337 ] 61-7~00-O~-0C0)

Subtotal
Total Reimbursement Z 27 l6)
Approved by 4 / g Date
/J’M ////ﬂf Approved ‘ d/ '3 /29
V4
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. --=Original Message:»-

_Aubject: FW: ACF boundary painting and western boundary VAST gate

~ Josh, Jesse: Bagk on 11/20/20 (in the early term of the gate matter) | submitted the below email and attached to the
. ACF committee, It includes my cost of the materials for the gate, a bucket of boundary line paint and steel

- stakes placed at ACF boundary survey pins., That tally totals $318.66 Since then and through Chris Hagerty's recen
. ACF survey work, | added five more stakes at $3.79 ea. X 5 =$18.95, for a new total bill of $337.61. It would be good i
. I could be reimbursed for these costs.

{l recently volunteered 6 hours of tractor / skidder work, with Ethan, bringing out tons of metal culverts and metal
jiding materials off the ACF.)

u, Wright //

Wright C. Preston, Vice President - Commercial Banking
210 College Street, 2nd. Floor | Burlington, VT 05401

- (802) 871-4484(0) | (802) 860-3659 {f)

nsbvt.com

-----Original Message----

From: Wright Preston

Sent: Friday, November 20, 2020 2:35 PM

To: Wright Preston <Wright.Preston@NSBVT.COM>; Amy Powers <amypowersvermont@gmail.com>; Ellen Kraft
<ellen.b.kraft@gmail.com>; Tapper, Ethan <Ethan.Tapper@vermont.gov>; Cecilia Danks <Cecilia.Danks@uvm.edu>;
Nick Neverisky <nickneverisky@gmall,com>; Jesse Crary <jessecrary@gmail.com>; Jim Monahan

- <jmimonahan@gmail.com>; Richmond Town Forest <richmondtownforest@gmail.com>; Caitlin Littlefield
<clittlef@gmail.com>; 'prelco@hotmail.com’' <prelco@hotmail.com>

Subject: ACF boundary painting and western boundary VAST gate

Hi: As we get ready to have trail designers plan out ACF trails | felt the need to make sure that all parties know the
location of the ACF boundaries. Theses boundaries, on the north and western side, were last painted in red about 20
years ago. That's my guess, any ways. It was hard to see the red blazes but fortunately some of the lines had old

- flagging and remnants of old barbed wire. | had repainted the eastern side with VYCC about 15 years ago. The
attached rough map shows (with black lines) where |'ve repainted the lines over the last three weekends, using a
gallon and half of red boundary paint. (Ethan helped me find and flag much of the western boundary.} | flagged the
ACF / Sunshine boundary (noted in dashed line on the map) and | installed steel stakes next to each ACF / Sunshine
survey pin so the pins can be easily found in the future. With your permission, 1'll repaint the ACF / Prelco

boundary. | repainted that boundary perhaps five years ago.

| think I've shared with you that we are currently having ATV issues and they appear to be originating from the west on
VAST Trail. (The conservation easement does not allow the public's use of ATV's on the property.) There is no gate
on the western boundary at the VAST Trail. There is a locked gate on the eastern boundary of the VAST Trail with
VYCC. A couple of years ago | asked the power company if they would donate a gate and they said yes but they would
have to install it just north of the power line ROW in the center of the ACF. A gate in the middle of the ACF did not
seem to make sense, so the offer was declined. In my experience, the only way to slow down and perhaps stop ATV

3
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Wright Preston .

From: Wright Preston <prelco@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 19, 2020 4:53 PM
To: Wright Preston
Subject: Paint

ong o ..wns;)

E Order Summary
1 em _ ; /
Y ¥ x Nelson Boundary Mark 150.%5 - Y= 3.7
: (Brush Typej Marking Palng ]
$99.96Gatton Case of 4 |
; Subtota) 39096
Shipping s3s
Tax 854

~ Total (USD) $150.85

Sent from my iPhone



Wright Preston

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Wright Preston <prelco@hotmail.com>
Thursday, November 19, 2020 4:54 PM
Wright Preston

ATV signs

Sent from my iPhone

$3.¢5X 8



* access is by installing locked gates with no ATV signs.

-~ Its ideal if the gate is installed this fall before snow and while it is still warm. | have time tomorrow to do 50. | can
drive my tractor and trailer up the VAST Trail to the western edge. !'ve got two old 10' telephone poles sections for
posts and the highway department is lending me a gas powered post hole digger. I've got all of the other parts and

- pieces. The attached bill that will be submitted for approval for boundary paint, gates, etc. and is for $318.66.

Given covid-19 social distancing needs, I'm not seeking assistance. BTW, I'm happy doing this stuff.
' Are folks okay with me installing the gate and seeking reimbursement? Sorry for the short notice.

: Thank you, Wright 734-9279

" Wright C. Preston, Vice President - Commercial Banking
- 210 College Street, 2nd. Floor | Burlington, VT 05401

~ {802) 871-4484(0) | (802) 860-3659 (f)

.+ nsbvt.com

" THIS E-MAIL MESSAGE, INCLUDING ANY ATTACHMENTS, IS FOR THE SOLE USE OF THE INTENDED RECIPIENT(S) AND

-~ MAY CONTAIN LEGALLY PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION, ANY UNAUTHOQRIZED REVIEW, USE,
DISCLOSURE, REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS STRICTLY PROHIBITED. IF YOU ARE NOT THE INTENDED RECIPIENT,
PLEASE IMMEDIATELY CONTACT THE SENDER BY REPLY E-MAIL AND DESTROY ALL COPIES OF THE ORIGINAL

MESSAGE. THANK YOU.

THIS E-MAIL MESSAGE, INCLUDING ANY ATTACHMENTS, 15 FOR THE SOLE USE OF THE INTENDED RECIPIENT{S) AND MAY CONTAIN LEGALLY PRIVILEGED AND
CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REVIEW, USE, DISCLOSURE, REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION 1S STRICTLY PROHIBITED. IF YOU ARE NOT THE
INTENOED RECIPIENT, PLEASE {IMMEDIATELY CONTACT THE SENDER 8Y REPLY E-MAIL AND DESTROY ALL COPIES OF THE ORIGINAL MESSAGE. THANK YOU,



